



City of Grand Island

Tuesday, October 13, 2009

Council Session

Item G29

**#2009-267 - Approving Bid Award for Furnishing and Installation
of Ball Field Lighting at Veterans Athletic Field Complex**

Staff Contact: Steve Paustian

Council Agenda Memo

From: Steve Paustian, Park and Recreation Director

Meeting: October 13, 2009

Subject: Approving Bid Award for Furnishing and Installation of Ball Field Lighting at Veterans Athletic Field Complex

Item #'s: G-29

Presenter(s): Steve Paustian, Park and Recreation Director

Background

On August 16, 2009 the Park and Recreation Department, advertised for bids for the Furnishing and Installation of Ball Field Lighting at the Veterans Athletic Complex. Six firms provided bids for this work. The low responsible bid was provided by Ensley Electrical Service Inc. of Grand Island, NE in the amount of \$231,277.00.

Discussion

Because of the relocation of the State Fair to Grand Island it is necessary to move the athletic complex currently located at Fonner Park to a new site. The new site is located just south of Eagle Scout Park. Ball Field lighting is necessary to allow for night games. Fund number 40044450 90122 Soccer/Bball Fields-Vets Home has funds budgeted for this purpose. Because of the favorable bid it is the intention of the Park and Recreation Department to have the lights currently located at Fonner Park erected at the new site to aid in the development of "Phase 2".

Alternatives

It appears that the Council has the following alternatives concerning the issue at hand. The Council may:

1. Move to approve
2. Refer the issue to a Committee
3. Postpone the issue to future date
4. Take no action on the issue

Recommendation

City Administration recommends that the Council approve the award of a contract to Ensley Electrical Services in the amount of \$231,277.00

Sample Motion

Move to award contract to Ensley Electrical Services to Furnish and Install Ball Field Lighting at the Veterans Athletic Field Complex.



Wes Nespor, Purchasing Agent

*Working Together for a
Better Tomorrow, Today*

BID OPENING

BID OPENING DATE: September 15, 2009 at 11:00 a.m.

FOR: Furnishing & Installation of Ball Field Lighting at Veterans Athletic Field Complex

DEPARTMENT: Parks & Recreation

ESTIMATE: \$400,000.00

FUND/ACCOUNT: 40044450-90122

PUBLICATION DATE: August 16, 2009

NO. POTENTIAL BIDDERS: 9

SUMMARY

Bidder:	<u>Jon Schwartz Electric</u> Omaha, NE	<u>IES Industrial, Inc.</u> Grand Island, NE
Exceptions:	Noted	Noted
Bid Price:	\$147,000.00	\$123,038.00
Alternate:		
Metal Poles:	\$329,145.00	\$309,151.00
Wood Poles:	No Bid	\$274,405.00
Concrete Poles:	No Bid	No Bid
Bidder:	<u>Middleton Electric, Inc.</u> Grand Island, NE	<u>Ensley Electrical Services, Inc.</u> Grand Island, NE
Exceptions:	None	Noted
Bid Price:	\$132,615.00	\$121,575.00
Alternate:		
Metal Poles:	\$327,800.00	\$333,277.00
Wood Poles:	\$238,040.00	\$231,277.00
Concrete Poles:	No Bid	No Bid

Bidder:	<u>Ardent Lighting Group</u> Knoxville, IA	<u>Heartland Electric Company</u> Grand Island, NE
Exceptions:	None	None
Bid Price:	\$170,146.00	\$140,976.00
Alternate:		
Metal Poles:	\$328,188.00	\$482,290.00
Wood Poles:	\$296,604.00	\$286,970.00
Concrete Poles:	\$306,166.00	No Bid

cc: Steve Paustian, Parks & Rec. Director
Dale Shotkoski, City Attorney
Jeff Pederson, City Administrator

Patti Buettner, Parks & Rec. Secretary
Wes Nespor, Purchasing Agent

P1363

R E S O L U T I O N 2009-267

WHEREAS, the City of Grand Island invited sealed bids for Furnishing and Installation of Ball Field Lighting at the new Veterans Athletic Field Complex, according to plans and specifications on file with the Parks and Recreation Department; and

WHEREAS, on September 15, 2009, bids were received, opened and reviewed; and

WHEREAS, Ensley Electrical Services, Inc. from Grand Island, Nebraska, submitted a bid in accordance with the terms of the advertisement of bids, plans and specifications and all other statutory requirements contained therein, such bid being in the amount of \$231,277.00.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED BY THE MAYOR AND COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF GRAND ISLAND, NEBRASKA, that the bid of Ensley Electrical Services, Inc. from Grand Island, Nebraska in the amount of \$231,277.00 for Furnishing and Installation of Ball Field Lighting at the new Veterans Athletic Field Complex is hereby approved as the lowest responsible bid.

- - -

Adopted by the City Council of the City of Grand Island, Nebraska, October 13, 2009.

Margaret Hornady, Mayor

Attest:

RaNae Edwards, City Clerk

Approved as to Form	☐ _____
October 8, 2009	☐ City Attorney