
Item I1
#2003-57 - Approving Agreement for Grant Funding for Exercise 
Equipment - Fire Department
The United states Congress established what is commonly called the Fire Act to help fire 
department across the country to be better prepared to meet the needs of the duties they 
perform. Those needs were put into five categories and any fire department can apply for 
grant funding in any category but only one category in any year. In the first year we applied 
for funds for physical fitness but we were not successful. In the second year we learned from 
our first effort and submitted an improved grant application. We were successful this time 
and council approved the acceptance of the grant in January this year. We then began the 
process of requesting bids on the equipment specified in the application.

The equipment is heavy duty commercial grade equipment that has the durability to 
withstand the daily use by several members of the department. The heavy duty construction 
and 6 horse power motor should hold up well. We did however include an extended warranty 
adding a year to the manufactures year warranty. The recommended low bid for the treadmill 
is a local business and service and maintenance should be readily available.

The details of the bids on the treadmills and the other equipment are as follows. On February 
6, 2003, six bids were opened for the purpose of purchasing fitness equipment including 
treadmills, weights and elliptical machines for the fire department.  Funds were made 
available through the Fire Act Grant which will provide funding for 90% or $46,850.40 
leaving the 10% city match of $5,205.60.  

There were six bids received for the treadmills ranging from $4,820 to $5,999 each.  Wayne's 
Cyclery of Grand Island was the lowest responsive bid and are requesting approval to 
purchase four treadmills at $4,820 each.  There were six bids received for the elliptical 
trainers ranging from $3,250 to $4,395 each.  Wayne's Cyclery of Grand Island was again 
the lowest responsive bid and are requesting approval to purchase eight trainers at $3,250 
each.  Also included in Wayne's Cyclery bid is a one year extended quarterly service charge 
of $400 for a total bid of $45,680.

There were four bids received for the Power Block Pro sets ranging from $625 to $925 each. 
Push-Pedal-Pull of Omaha, NE was the lowest responsive bid and we are requesting approval 
to purchase eight of these at $625 each.  There were five bids received for weight benches 
ranging from $225 to $499 each.  Push-Pedal-Pull of Omaha was again the lowest bid at 
$225 each and are requesting approval to purchase four benches.  Their total bid will be 
$5,900.
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We also received four bids for Power Block Pro Stands ranging from $59.50 to $119 each.  
Nova Health Equipment of Omaha, NE was the lowest bid and are requesting approval to 
purchase eight stands for a total bid of $476.
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Working Together for a 

                     Better Tomorrow, Today 
 
 BID OPENING 
 
BID OPENING DATE:  February 6, 2003 
 
FOR:     Exercise Equipment 
 
DEPARTMENT:   Fire Department 
 
ENGINEER’S ESTIMATE: $52,180.00 
 
FUND/ACCOUNT:   10022101-85615 
     10022101-85540 
 
PUBLICATION DATE:  January 25, 2003 
 
NO. POTENTIAL BIDDERS:  
 SUMMARY 
 
Bidder:  Wayne’s Cyclery    Priority One Fitness 
   Grand Island, NE    Omaha, NE 
Exceptions:  NONE      NOTED 
Bid Price:  (1)  $19,280.00 (4)  No Bid  (1)  $22,400.00 (4)  $   952.00 
   (2)  $13,000.00 (5)  No Bid  (2)  $15,400.00 (5)  $1,116.00 
   (3)  No Bid     (3)  $  6,992.00 
 
Bidder:  NOVA Health Equipment   Central States Fitness Systems  
   Omaha, NE     Greenwood, MO 
Exceptions:  NOTED     NOTED 
Bid Price:  (1)  $23,400.00 (4)  $    476.00  (1)  $23,996.00 (4)  No Bid 
   (2)  $17,580.00 (5)  $ 3,160.00  (2)  $13,996.00 (5)  $1,996.00 
   (3)  $  7,400.00    (3)  No Bid 
 
Bidder:  Body Basics     Push-Pedal-Pull 
   Lincoln, NE     Omaha, NE 
Exceptions:  NONE      NOTED 
Bid Price:  (1)  $19,280.00 (4)  $    760.00  (1)  $19,900.00 (4)  $720.00 
   (2)  $13,280.00 (5)  $ 1,080.00  (2)  $15,400.00 (5)  $900.00 
   (3)  $  5,760.00    (3)  $  5,000.00 
 
cc: Jim Rowell, Fire Chief 

RaNae Edwards, City Clerk 



Dale Shotkoski, Purchasing Agent 
 Laura Berthelsen, Legal Assistant 
              P802 



 
Approved as to Form ¤ ___________ 
February 27, 2003 ¤  City Attorney  

 R E S O L U T I O N    2003-57 
 
 WHEREAS, the City of Grand Island invited sealed bids for Exercise Equipment for the 
Fire Department, according to plans and specifications on file with the Purchasing Division of the Legal 
Department; and 
 
 WHEREAS, on February 6, 2003, bids were received, opened and reviewed; and 
 
 WHEREAS, Wayne's Cyclery of Grand Island, Nebraska, submitted a bid in accordance 
with the terms of the advertisement of bids and plans and specifications and all other statutory requirements 
contained therein, such bid being in the amount of $4,820 per unit for 4 treadmills and $3,250 per unit for 8 
elliptical trainers with a one year extended quarterly service charge of $400 for a total bid of $45,680 for 
those items; and 
 
 WHEREAS, Nova Health Equipment of Omaha, Nebraska, submitted a bid in accordance 
with the terms of the advertisement of bids and plans and specifications and all other statutory requirements 
contained therein, such bid being in the amount of $59.50 per unit for 8 Power Block Pro stands for a total 
amount of $476.00 for those items; and 
 
 WHEREAS, Push-Pedal-Pull of Omaha, Nebraska, submitted a bid in accordance with the 
terms of the advertisement of bids and plans and specifications and all other statutory requirements 
contained therein, such bid being in the amount of $625.00 per unit for 8 Power Block Pro sets and 
$225.00 per unit for 4 weight benches for a total bid of $5,900 for those items; and 
 
 WHEREAS, the equipment is being purchased through a Federal Emergency Management 
Agency grant, with the City's portion of such funding to be 10% of the total costs or approximately 
$5,205.60. 
 
 NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED BY THE MAYOR AND COUNCIL OF 
THE CITY OF GRAND ISLAND, NEBRASKA, that: 
 
 1. The bid of Wayne's Cyclery of Grand Island, Nebraska, in the amount of $4,820 per unit 
for 4 treadmills and $3,250 per unit for 8 elliptical trainers with a one year extended quarterly service charge 
of $400 for a total bid of $45,680 is hereby approved as the lowest responsible bid for those items. 
 
 2. The bid of Nova Health Equipment of Omaha, Nebraska, in the amount of $59.50 per unit 
for 8 Power Block Pro stands is hereby approved as the lowest responsible bid for that item. 
 
 3. The bid of Push-Pedal-Pull of Omaha, Nebraska, in the amount of $625.00 per unit for 8 
Power Block Pro sets and $225.00 per unit for 4 weight benches for a total bid of $5,900 is hereby 
approved as the lowest responsible bid for those items. 
 - - - 
Adopted by the City Council of the City of Grand Island, Nebraska, March 4, 2003. 
 
        _______________________________________ 

RaNae Edwards, City Clerk 


