

City of Grand Island

Tuesday, October 14, 2014 Council Session

Item G-9

#2014-315 - Approving Bid Award for (1) New Compact Excavator and (1) New Skid-Steer Loader

Staff Contact: Todd McCoy

Council Agenda Memo

From:	Todd McCoy, Parks and Recreation Director	
Meeting:	October 14, 2014	
Subject:	Bid Award for (1) New Compact Excavator and (1) New Skid-Steer Loader for use within the Cemetery Division	
Item #'s:	G-9	
Presenter(s):	Todd McCoy, Parks and Recreation Director	

Background

On October 2, 2014 the Parks and Recreation Department received bids for the purchase of one (1) new compact excavator and one (1) new skid-steer loader for use within the Cemetery Division. The replacement items are necessary as the current equipment is becoming less dependable. The new equipment will provide additional years of service and meets the requirements of the Cemetery operation.

Discussion

Bids were received from five (5) companies.

	Compact Excavator	Skid-Steer Loader
NMC, Inc.	\$46,692.00	\$36,621.00
Doniphan, Nebraska	CAT 303.5E CR	CAT242D
Titan Machinery New Holland	\$59,575.00	\$35,150.00
Grand Island, Nebraska	New Holland E35B	New Holland L220
Titan Machinery	\$60,300.00	\$38,400
Lincoln, Nebraska	Case CX55B	Case SR210
Central Nebraska Bobcat	\$41,668.32	\$30,882.17
Grand Island, Nebraska	Bobcat E35	Bobcat S570
Ditch Witch	\$56,551.00	\$43,934.00
Grand Island, Nebraska	Yanmar V10 45-6A	Yanmar S190 R1

Compact Excavator

Used primarily for digging graves and repairs of underground irrigation lines as needed. The \$41,668.32 Bobcat E55 unit from Central Nebraska Bobcat is recommended for purchase.



Skid-Steer Loader

This unit is primarily used loading dirt and snow removal. The \$30,882.17 Bobcat S570 unit from Central Nebraska Bobcat is recommended for purchase.



Funds are budgeted this year for this purchase in capital account 10044405-85615.

Alternatives

It appears that the Council has the following alternatives concerning the issue at hand. The Council may:

- 1. Move to approve
- 2. Refer the issue to a Committee
- 3. Postpone the issue to future date
- 4. Take no action on the issue

Recommendation

City Administration recommends that the City Council approve the purchase of the Bobcat E55 Compact Excavator and the Bobcat S570 Skid-Steer Loader.

Sample Motion

Move to approve the purchase of the Bobcat E55 Compact Excavator and the Bobcat S570 Skid-Steer Loader from Central Nebraska Bobcat of Grand Island, Nebraska. The total purchase price for equipment is \$72,550.49.

Purchasing Division of Legal Department INTEROFFICE MEMORANDUM

Stacy Nonhof, Purchasing Agent

Working Together for a Better Tomorrow, Today

BID OPENING

BID OPENING DATE:	October 2, 2014 at 2:00 p.m.	
FOR:	(1) New Compact Excavator & (1) New Skid-Steer Loader	
DEPARTMENT:	Parks & Recreation	
ESTIMATE:	\$42,000.00 - Excavator \$31,000.00 - Skid-Steer Loader	
FUND/ACCOUNT:	10044405-85615	
PUBLICATION DATE:	September 16, 2014	

5

NO. POTENTIAL BIDDERS:

SUMMARY

Bidder:	<u>NMC, Inc.</u> Doniphan, NE	<u>Titan Machinery New Holland</u> Grand Island, NE
Exceptions:	Noted	Noted
Bid Price:		
Compactor:	\$46,692.00	\$59,675.00
Make & Model:	CAT 303.5E CR	New Holland E35B
Skid-Steer Loader:	\$36,621.00	\$35,150.00
Make & Model:	CAT 242D	New Holland L220
Option:		
Angle Broom Attachment:	\$ 5,540.00	\$ 4,995.00
Make & Model:	Virnig VAB72	Land Pride AB72
Total Price:	\$88,853.00	\$99,820.00

Lincoln, NEGrand Island, NEExceptions:NotedNotedBid Price: Compactor:\$60,300.00\$41,668.32Make & Model:Case CX55BBobcat E35Skid-Steer Loader:\$38,400.00\$30,882.17Make & Model:Case SR210\$30,882.17Option: Angle Broom Attachment:No Bid\$ 4,009.04Make & Model:S98,700.00\$76,559.53Bidder:Ditch Witch Grand Island, NE\$76,559.53Bidder:Ditch Witch Grand Island, NE\$76,559.53Bid Price: Compactor:\$56,551.00 Yanmar V10 45-6A\$4,009.01 Bid Yanmar S190 R1Option: Angle Broom Attachment:\$ 4,125.00 Erskine\$4,125.00 Erskine	Bidder:	Titan Machinery	<u>Central Nebraska Bobcat</u>
Bid Price: Compactor:\$60,300.00 Case CX55B\$41,668.32 Bobcat E35Skid-Steer Loader:\$38,400.00 Case SR210\$30,882.17 Bobcat S570Option: Angle Broom Attachment:No Bid\$ 4,009.04 Bobcat 68" ABTotal Price:\$98,700.00\$76,559.53Bidder:Ditch Witch Grand Island, NE Exceptions:S66,551.00 Yanmar V10 45-6ABid Price: Compactor:\$\$43,934.00 Yanmar S190 R1Option: Angle Broom Attachment:\$ 4,125.00		Lincoln, NE	Grand Island, NE
Compactor:\$60,300.00\$41,668.32Make & Model:Case CX55BBobcat E35Skid-Steer Loader:\$38,400.00\$30,882.17Make & Model:Case SR210Bobcat S570Option:Angle Broom Attachment:No Bid\$ 4,009.04Make & Model:S98,700.00\$76,559.53Bidder:Ditch Witch Grand Island, NE\$76,559.53Bid Price:S56,551.00\$76,559.53Compactor:\$56,551.00Make & Model:Yanmar V10 45-6ASkid-Steer Loader:\$43,934.00Make & Model:Yanmar S190 R1Option: Angle Broom Attachment:\$ 4,125.00	Exceptions:	Noted	Noted
Make & Model:Case CX55BBobcat E35Skid-Steer Loader:\$38,400.00\$30,882.17Make & Model:Case SR210Bobcat S570Option:No Bid\$ 4,009.04Make & Model:No Bid\$ 4,009.04Make & Model:\$98,700.00\$76,559.53Bidder:Ditch Witch Grand Island, NE\$76,559.53Bid Price:\$56,551.00Compactor:\$56,551.00Make & Model:Yanmar V10 45-6ASkid-Steer Loader:\$43,934.00Make & Model:Yanmar S190 R1Option: Angle Broom Attachment:\$ 4,125.00	Bid Price:		
Skid-Steer Loader:\$38,400.00 Case SR210\$30,882.17 Bobcat \$570Option: Angle Broom Attachment:No Bid\$ 4,009.04 Bobcat 68" ABTotal Price:\$98,700.00\$76,559.53Bidder:Ditch Witch Grand Island, NE Noted\$76,559.53Bid Price: Compactor:\$56,551.00 Yanmar V10 45-6A\$43,934.00 Yanmar S190 R1Skid-Steer Loader:\$43,934.00 Yanmar S190 R1\$4,125.00	Compactor:	\$60,300.00	\$41,668.32
Make & Model:Case SR210Bobcat S570Option: Angle Broom Attachment:No Bid\$ 4,009.04 Bobcat 68" ABTotal Price:\$98,700.00\$76,559.53Bidder:Ditch Witch Grand Island, NE Exceptions:\$76,559.53Bid Price: Compactor:\$56,551.00 Yanmar V10 45-6A\$43,934.00 Yanmar S190 R1Option: Angle Broom Attachment:\$ 4,125.00	Make & Model:	Case CX55B	Bobcat E35
Make & Model:Case SR210Bobcat S570Option: Angle Broom Attachment:No Bid\$ 4,009.04 Bobcat 68" ABTotal Price:\$98,700.00\$76,559.53Bidder:Ditch Witch Grand Island, NE Exceptions:\$76,559.53Bid Price: Compactor:\$56,551.00 Yanmar V10 45-6A\$43,934.00 Yanmar S190 R1Option: Angle Broom Attachment:\$ 4,125.00	Skid-Steer Loader:	\$38,400.00	\$30.882.17
Angle Broom Attachment:No Bid\$ 4,009.04 Bobcat 68" ABMake & Model:\$98,700.00\$76,559.53Total Price:\$98,700.00\$76,559.53Bidder:Ditch Witch Grand Island, NE Exceptions:NotedBid Price: Compactor:\$56,551.00 Yanmar V10 45-6ASkid-Steer Loader:\$43,934.00 Yanmar S190 R1Option: Angle Broom Attachment:\$ 4,125.00			,
Angle Broom Attachment:No Bid\$ 4,009.04 Bobcat 68" ABMake & Model:\$98,700.00\$76,559.53Total Price:\$98,700.00\$76,559.53Bidder:Ditch Witch Grand Island, NE Exceptions:NotedBid Price: Compactor:\$56,551.00 Yanmar V10 45-6ASkid-Steer Loader:\$43,934.00 Yanmar S190 R1Option: Angle Broom Attachment:\$ 4,125.00			
Make & Model:Bobcat 68" ABTotal Price:\$98,700.00\$76,559.53Bidder:Ditch Witch Grand Island, NE*********************************	-	No Did	S 4 000 04
Total Price:\$98,700.00\$76,559.53Bidder:Ditch Witch Grand Island, NEExceptions:NotedBid Price: Compactor:\$56,551.00 Yanmar V10 45-6ASkid-Steer Loader:\$43,934.00 Yanmar S190 R1Option: Angle Broom Attachment:\$ 4,125.00			
Bidder:Ditch Witch Grand Island, NEExceptions:NotedBid Price: Compactor:\$56,551.00 Yanmar V10 45-6ASkid-Steer Loader:\$43,934.00 Yanmar S190 R1Option: Angle Broom Attachment:\$ 4,125.00	Make & Mouel.		bobcat oo Ab
Grand Island, NEExceptions:NotedBid Price: Compactor:\$56,551.00Make & Model:Yanmar V10 45-6ASkid-Steer Loader:\$43,934.00Make & Model:Yanmar S190 R1Option: Angle Broom Attachment:\$ 4,125.00	Total Price:	\$98,700.00	\$76,559.53
Grand Island, NEExceptions:NotedBid Price: Compactor:\$56,551.00Make & Model:Yanmar V10 45-6ASkid-Steer Loader:\$43,934.00Make & Model:Yanmar S190 R1Option: Angle Broom Attachment:\$ 4,125.00			
Grand Island, NEExceptions:NotedBid Price: Compactor:\$56,551.00Make & Model:Yanmar V10 45-6ASkid-Steer Loader:\$43,934.00Make & Model:Yanmar S190 R1Option: Angle Broom Attachment:\$ 4,125.00			
Exceptions:NotedBid Price: Compactor:\$56,551.00Make & Model:\$56,551.00Make & Model:Yanmar V10 45-6ASkid-Steer Loader: Make & Model:\$43,934.00 Yanmar S190 R1Option: Angle Broom Attachment:\$ 4,125.00	Bidder:	Ditch Witch	
Bid Price: Compactor: \$56,551.00 Make & Model: Yanmar V10 45-6A Skid-Steer Loader: \$43,934.00 Make & Model: Yanmar S190 R1 Option: Angle Broom Attachment: \$ 4,125.00		Grand Island, NE	
Compactor:\$56,551.00Make & Model:Yanmar V10 45-6ASkid-Steer Loader:\$43,934.00Make & Model:Yanmar \$190 R1Option:Yanmar \$190 R1	Exceptions:	Noted	
Compactor:\$56,551.00Make & Model:Yanmar V10 45-6ASkid-Steer Loader:\$43,934.00Make & Model:Yanmar S190 R1Option:Yanmar S190 R1	Bid Price :		
Make & Model:Yanmar V10 45-6ASkid-Steer Loader:\$43,934.00Make & Model:Yanmar \$190 R1Option:Yanmar \$190 R1Angle Broom Attachment:\$ 4,125.00		\$56,551,00	
Skid-Steer Loader:\$43,934.00Make & Model:Yanmar \$190 R1Option:		· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·	
Make & Model:Yanmar S190 R1Option:Angle Broom Attachment:\$ 4,125.00	Marc & Mouth		
Option: Angle Broom Attachment: \$ 4,125.00	Skid-Steer Loader:	\$43,934.00	
Angle Broom Attachment: \$ 4,125.00	Make & Model:	Yanmar S190 R1	
Angle Broom Attachment: \$ 4,125.00	Ontion:		
8	1	\$ 4 125 00	
Mare & Model.	8	,	
	Make & Mouel.		
Total Price: \$104,610.00	Total Price:	\$104,610.00	
		-	

cc: Todd McCoy, Parks & Recreation Director Mary Lou Brown, City Administrator Stacy Nonhoff, Purchasing Agent

Patti Buettner, Parks Secretary Jaye Monter, Finance Director Mark Sands, Cemetery Superintendent

P1768

RESOLUTION 2014-315

WHEREAS, the City of Grand Island invited sealed bids for one (1) new Compact Excavator and one (1) new Skid-Steer Loader, according to plans and specifications on file with the Parks and Recreation Department, Cemetery Division; and

WHEREAS, on October 2, 2014, five (5) bids were received, opened and reviewed; and

WHEREAS, Central Nebraska Bobcat from Grand Island, Nebraska submitted a bid for one (1) new Compact Excavator and one (1) new Skid-Steer Loader in accordance with the terms of the advertisement of bids, plans and specifications and all other statutory requirements contained therein, such bid being in the amount of \$72,550.49.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED BY THE MAYOR AND COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF GRAND ISLAND, NEBRASKA, that the bid of Central Nebraska Bobcat from Grand Island, Nebraska, in the amount of \$72,550.49 for one (1) new Compact Excavator and one (1) new Skid-Steer Loader is hereby approved as the lowest responsible bid.

- - -

Adopted by the City Council of the City of Grand Island, Nebraska, October 14, 2014.

Jay Vavricek, Mayor

Attest:

Nicki Stoltenberg, Assistant to the City Administrator

Approved as to Form ¤_____ October 10, 2014 ¤ City Attorney