
City of Grand Island
Tuesday, June 10, 2014

Council Session

Item G-8

#2014-144 - Approving Bid Award - Pad-Mount Switch Gear, #2 
Aluminum URD Cable, and Various other Power Cable - Utilities 
Department

Staff Contact: Tim Luchsinger, Stacy Nonhof
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Council Agenda Memo 
From: Tim Luchsinger, Utilities Director

Stacy Nonhof, Assistant City Attorney

Meeting: June 10, 2014

Subject: Pad Mount Switch Gear, #2 Aluminum URD Cable, 1/0, 
4/0, 500 & 750 CU Power Cable

Item #’s: G-8

Presenter(s): Timothy Luchsinger, Utilities Director

Background 

The Electric Stores Department needs to replace inventory and plan for the construction 
needs of the Underground Department this summer.  Specifications were developed for 
the needed items, bid documents were created and mailed to five potential bidders and 
posted on the City’s web site.  Sufficient funds are budgeted in this year’s budget to 
replace this material.  The estimate of this bid is $1,400,000.00.

Discussion

Bids were opened May 27, 2014 at 2:00 p.m.  Four bids were received.  Bid prices were 
required to be firm for 30 days.  Three bidders took exception to parts of that 
requirement.  Bids taking that exception were considered not compliant and were not 
evaluated.  Bidders and item numbers that took exception are: 

Kriz Davis – Items #6, 7, 8, 9, 10, 11, 12, 13, 14
Wesco – Item #1 (non-stainless steel, otherwise no exceptions)
Graybar  – Items #5, 6, 7, 8, 9, 10, 11, 12, 13, 14 (no bid on Items #1, 2)
Dutton-Lainson – Items #11, 12

  The results of the remainder of the bids are as follows:
Kriz-
Davis

Wesco Graybar Dutton-Lainson

1 PSE12 $16,635.00 -------- No Bid $16,141.00
2 ND450 No Bid $1,910.00 No Bid No Bid
3 #2 Elbow $21.55 $21.45 $21.38 $21.15
4 1/0 Elbow $21.55 $21.45 $22.00 $21.15
5 750 Elbow $344.00 No Bid -------- No Bid
6 #2 Cable -------- $1.72 -------- No Bid
7 1/0 Cable -------- $3.30 -------- No Bid
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8 4/0 Cable -------- $5.32 -------- No Bid
Kriz-
Davis

Wesco Graybar Dutton-Lainson

9 500 MCM Cable -------- $10.28 -------- No Bid
10 750 MCM Cable -------- $14.49 -------- No Bid
11 1/0 SDB CU -------- $1.38 -------- --------
12 350 MCM SDB CU -------- $4.56 -------- --------
13 2” PVC -------- $0.56 -------- $0.5250
14 6” Bore Gard -------- $5.50 -------- $5.7200

 + freight $877.00

Low bids for each item are as follows:

1 1 ea @ $16,141.00 =  $16,141.00 Dutton-Lainson
2 8 ea @ $1,910.00 = $15,280.00 Wesco
2 280 ea@ $21.15 =  $5,922.00 Dutton-Lainson
4 240 ea @ $21.15 =  $5,076.00 Dutton-Lainson
5 150 ea @ $344.00 = $51,600.00 Kriz-Davis
6 45,000 ea @ $1.72 = $77,400.00 Wesco
7 120,000 ea @ $3.30 = $396,000.00 Wesco
8 12,000 ea @ $5.32 =  $63,840.00 Wesco
9 14,400 ea @ $10.28 =  $148,032.00 Wesco

10 28,800 ea @ $14.49 =  $417,312.00 Wesco
11 30,000 ea @ $1.38 =  $41,400.00 Wesco
12 12,000 ea @ $4.56 =  $54,720.00 Wesco
13 44,800 ea @ $0.5250 =  $23,520.00 Dutton-Lainson
14 3,000 ea @ $5.72 = 

+ freight
 $17,160.00

 + freight $877
Dutton-Lainson

Total = $1,334,280.00

Items #13 & 14 bid by Dutton-Lainson specified the bid as all or none.  This puts the 
total for the two items by Wesco at $41,588.00 and Dutton-Lainson at $41,557.00, 
therefore, the low bid for Items #13 & 14 are $41,557.00 from Dutton-Lainson.

Alternatives

It appears that the Council has the following alternatives concerning the issue at hand. 
The Council may:

1. Make a motion to approve
2. Refer the issue to a Committee
3. Postpone the issue to future date
4.       Take no action on the issue
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Recommendation

City Administration recommends that City Council approve the purchase of Pad Mount, 
Switch Gear, #2 Aluminum URD Cable and Power Cable from the following bidders:

Items #1, 3, 4, 13 and 14 from Dutton-Lainson in the amount of $67,819.00 + $877.00 
for freight.

Items #2, 6, 7, 8, 9, 10, 11 and 12 from Wesco in the amount of $1,213,984.00.

Item #5 from Kriz-Davis in the amount of $51,600.00.

Total purchase price of all items is $1,334,280.00.

Sample Motion

Move to approve the purchase of Pad Mount Switch Gear, #2 Aluminum URD and 
Power Cable in the amount of $1,334,280.00 specified by items and bidders below:

Items #1, 3, 4, 13 and 14 from Dutton-Lainson in the amount of $67,819.00 + $877.00 
for freight.

Items #2, 6, 7, 8, 9, 10, 11 and 12 from Wesco in the amount of $1,213,984.00.

Item #5 from Kriz-Davis in the amount of $51,600.00.
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Purchasing Division of Legal Department
INTEROFFICE MEMORANDUM

  
Stacy Nonhof, Purchasing Agent

Working Together for a
                    Better Tomorrow, Today

BID OPENING

BID OPENING DATE: May 27, 2014 at 2:00 p.m.

FOR: Pad-Mount Switch Gear, #2 Aluminum URD Cable,
1/0, 4/0, 500 & 750 CU Power Cable

DEPARTMENT: Utilities

ESTIMATE: $1,400,000.00

FUND/ACCOUNT: 520.15500

PUBLICATION DATE: May 6, 2014

NO. POTENTIAL BIDDERS: 5
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SUMMARY

Bidder: Dutton-Lainson Company
Hastings, NE

Exceptions: Noted

Bid Price:

#
Quantity 

Requested
City Stock

Code Description
No 

Subs
Vendor’s

Bid Mfg. Delivery
1. 1 108595 Each – Padmount Switch Gear – Federal Pacific 

#PSE-12-44132-AS3-F2-HR-T7, Painted light Gray, 
Stainless Steel Cabinet, DEADFRONT, Air 
Insulated, 15kV, 95kV BIL, with one(1) 3-Pole, 600 
Amp. Group Operated Auto-Jet Switch and Three (3) 
3-Phase Sets of use Mountings for DBU or SMU-20 
Fuses.  Includes Nine (9) Sets of FP Fuse End 
Fittings, Hinged Roof and One (1) 12” Non-
Compartmental Stainless Steel Base Spacer.  Federal 
Pacific or S & C only.

$16,141.00 Federal Pacific
SMU-20 & DB4 
Fuses
Not Included In 
Price

6 – 8 weeks

2. 8 113450 Each – Nordic ND-450-WG-S10135XX-P107 
Sectionalizing Cabinets, 600 Amp., Painted Willow 
Green

X No Bid

3. 280 118166 Each – Cooper #LE215AB04T Stick Op Elbows - #2 
Aluminum URD

$21.15 each Elastimold 2-4 weeks

4. 240 118110 Each – Cooper #LE215AB05T Stick Op Elbows – 
1/0 Power Cable

$21.15 each Elsatimold 2-4 weeks

5. 150 120676 Each – Cooper #TP615H24TC T-OP-KIT Stick Op 
Elbows 750 MCM Power Cable – Consisting of:  (1) 
DT625T T-Body, (1) LRTP615 LB Reduce Tap Plug, 
(1) CA625H Cable Adapter, (1) CC6C24T CU 
COMP CONN. & (1) LPC215 LB Protective Cap

X No Bid

6. 45,000 128102 Ft. - #2 15kV Aluminum URD Stranded Compressed 
Concentric 220 Mil as per the City of Grand Island 
Specs Mfg. #161-23-3060 on 2,500 Reels

No Bid

7. 120,000 128410 Ft. – 1/0 15kV Copper Power Cable – COMPACT – 
MV-105 as per the City of Grand Island Specs on 60 
x 2,000 ft. new non-returnable reels – Okonite & 
Kerite only

No Bid

8. 12,000 128440 Ft. – 4/0 15kV Copper power cable – COMPACT – 
MV-105 as per the City of Grand Island Specs on 6 x 
2,000 ft. new non-returnable reels – Okonite & Kerite 
only

No Bid

9. 14,400 128500 Ft. – 500 MCM 15kV Copper Power Cable 
COMPACT – MV-105 as per the City of Grand 
Island Specs on 12 x 1,200 ft. new, non-returnable 
reels – Okonite & Kerite only

No Bid

10. 28,800 128750 Ft. – 750 MCM 15kV Copper Power Cable – 
COMPACT – MV-105 as per City of Grand Island 
Specs on 24 x 1,200 ft. new, non-returnable reels – 
Okonite & Kerite only

No Bid

11. 30,000 146010 Ft. – 1/0 19Str. Soft Drawn Bare Copper on 15 x 
2,000 ft. new reels

$1,268.00 mft Nehring 1-2 weeks

12. 12,000 146350 Ft. – 350 MCM 37Str. Soft Drawn Bare Copper on 24 
x 500 ft. new reels

$4,208.00 mft Nehring 1-2 weeks

13. 44,800 130220 Ft. – 2” x 20 ft. PVC Sch. 40 Conduit w/belled ends 
(2,800 ft. lifts)

$52.50 cft Prime 1-3 weeks

14. 3,000 133620 Ft. 6” x 20 ft. Bore-Gard Conduit, Carlon #BG640SP-
020

$572.00 cft Prime 1-3 weeks
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Bidder: Wesco Distribution, Inc.
Sioux City, IA

Exceptions: None

Bid Price:

#
Quantity 

Requested
City Stock

Code Description
No 

Subs
Vendor’s

Bid Mfg. Delivery
1. 1 108595 Each – Padmount Switch Gear – Federal Pacific 

#PSE-12-44132-AS3-F2-HR-T7, Painted light Gray, 
Stainless Steel Cabinet, DEADFRONT, Air 
Insulated, 15kV, 95kV BIL, with one(1) 3-Pole, 600 
Amp. Group Operated Auto-Jet Switch and Three (3) 
3-Phase Sets of use Mountings for DBU or SMU-20 
Fuses.  Includes Nine (9) Sets of FP Fuse End 
Fittings, Hinged Roof and One (1) 12” Non-
Compartmental Stainless Steel Base Spacer.  Federal 
Pacific or S & C only.

$13,639.00 Federal Pacific 6-8 weeks

2. 8 113450 Each – Nordic ND-450-WG-S10135XX-P107 
Sectionalizing Cabinets, 600 Amp., Painted Willow 
Green

X $1,910.00 each Nordic 7-8 weeks

3. 280 118166 Each – Cooper #LE215AB04T Stick Op Elbows - #2 
Aluminum URD

$21.45 each Elastimold 2 weeks

4. 240 118110 Each – Cooper #LE215AB05T Stick Op Elbows – 
1/0 Power Cable

$21.45 each Elastimold 2 weeks

5. 150 120676 Each – Cooper #TP615H24TC T-OP-KIT Stick Op 
Elbows 750 MCM Power Cable – Consisting of:  (1) 
DT625T T-Body, (1) LRTP615 LB Reduce Tap Plug, 
(1) CA625H Cable Adapter, (1) CC6C24T CU 
COMP CONN. & (1) LPC215 LB Protective Cap

X No Bid

6. 45,000 128102 Ft. - #2 15kV Aluminum URD Stranded Compressed 
Concentric 220 Mil as per the City of Grand Island 
Specs Mfg. #161-23-3060 on 2,500 Reels

$1.72 ft OKONITE 4-8 weeks

7. 120,000 128410 Ft. – 1/0 15kV Copper Power Cable – COMPACT – 
MV-105 as per the City of Grand Island Specs on 60 
x 2,000 ft. new non-returnable reels – Okonite & 
Kerite only

$3.30 ft OKONITE 6-8 weeks

8. 12,000 128440 Ft. – 4/0 15kV Copper power cable – COMPACT – 
MV-105 as per the City of Grand Island Specs on 6 x 
2,000 ft. new non-returnable reels – Okonite & Kerite 
only

$5.32 ft OKONITE Stock to 6 weeks

9. 14,400 128500 Ft. – 500 MCM 15kV Copper Power Cable 
COMPACT – MV-105 as per the City of Grand 
Island Specs on 12 x 1,200 ft. new, non-returnable 
reels – Okonite & Kerite only

$10.28 ft OKONITE 4-6 WEEKS

10. 28,800 128750 Ft. – 750 MCM 15kV Copper Power Cable – 
COMPACT – MV-105 as per City of Grand Island 
Specs on 24 x 1,200 ft. new, non-returnable reels – 
Okonite & Kerite only

$14.49 ft OKONITE Stock to 6 weeks

11. 30,000 146010 Ft. – 1/0 19Str. Soft Drawn Bare Copper on 15 x 
2,000 ft. new reels

$1.38 ft Alan 1 week

12. 12,000 146350 Ft. – 350 MCM 37Str. Soft Drawn Bare Copper on 24 
x 500 ft. new reels

$4.56 ft Alan 1 week

13. 44,800 130220 Ft. – 2” x 20 ft. PVC Sch. 40 Conduit w/belled ends 
(2,800 ft. lifts)

$.56 ft Prime 2 weeks

14. 3,000 133620 Ft. 6” x 20 ft. Bore-Gard Conduit, Carlon #BG640SP-
020

$5.50 ft Prime 2 weeks
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Bidder: Graybar Electric
Jefferson City, MO

Exceptions: Noted

Bid Price:

#
Quantity 

Requested
City Stock

Code Description
No 

Subs
Vendor’s

Bid Mfg. Delivery
1. 1 108595 Each – Padmount Switch Gear – Federal Pacific 

#PSE-12-44132-AS3-F2-HR-T7, Painted light Gray, 
Stainless Steel Cabinet, DEADFRONT, Air 
Insulated, 15kV, 95kV BIL, with one(1) 3-Pole, 600 
Amp. Group Operated Auto-Jet Switch and Three (3) 
3-Phase Sets of use Mountings for DBU or SMU-20 
Fuses.  Includes Nine (9) Sets of FP Fuse End 
Fittings, Hinged Roof and One (1) 12” Non-
Compartmental Stainless Steel Base Spacer.  Federal 
Pacific or S & C only.

No Bid

2. 8 113450 Each – Nordic ND-450-WG-S10135XX-P107 
Sectionalizing Cabinets, 600 Amp., Painted Willow 
Green

X No Bid

3. 280 118166 Each – Cooper #LE215AB04T Stick Op Elbows - #2 
Aluminum URD

$21.38 Hubbell 3-4 weeks

4. 240 118110 Each – Cooper #LE215AB05T Stick Op Elbows – 
1/0 Power Cable

$22.00 Hubbell 3-4 weeks

5. 150 120676 Each – Cooper #TP615H24TC T-OP-KIT Stick Op 
Elbows 750 MCM Power Cable – Consisting of:  (1) 
DT625T T-Body, (1) LRTP615 LB Reduce Tap Plug, 
(1) CA625H Cable Adapter, (1) CC6C24T CU 
COMP CONN. & (1) LPC215 LB Protective Cap

X $210.35 Hubbell 45 days

6. 45,000 128102 Ft. - #2 15kV Aluminum URD Stranded Compressed 
Concentric 220 Mil as per the City of Grand Island 
Specs Mfg. #161-23-3060 on 2,500 Reels

$1.950 Kerite 4 weeks

7. 120,000 128410 Ft. – 1/0 15kV Copper Power Cable – COMPACT – 
MV-105 as per the City of Grand Island Specs on 60 
x 2,000 ft. new non-returnable reels – Okonite & 
Kerite only

$3.889 Kerite 6 weeks

8. 12,000 128440 Ft. – 4/0 15kV Copper power cable – COMPACT – 
MV-105 as per the City of Grand Island Specs on 6 x 
2,000 ft. new non-returnable reels – Okonite & Kerite 
only

$5.696 Kerite 6 weeks

9. 14,400 128500 Ft. – 500 MCM 15kV Copper Power Cable 
COMPACT – MV-105 as per the City of Grand 
Island Specs on 12 x 1,200 ft. new, non-returnable 
reels – Okonite & Kerite only

$11.310 Kerite 6 weeks

10. 28,800 128750 Ft. – 750 MCM 15kV Copper Power Cable – 
COMPACT – MV-105 as per City of Grand Island 
Specs on 24 x 1,200 ft. new, non-returnable reels – 
Okonite & Kerite only

$15.940 Kerite 6 weeks

11. 30,000 146010 Ft. – 1/0 19Str. Soft Drawn Bare Copper on 15 x 
2,000 ft. new reels

$1.27717
$1.34860

Service
Alan

1 week
2 weeks (Firm)

12. 12,000 146350 Ft. – 350 MCM 37Str. Soft Drawn Bare Copper on 24 
x 500 ft. new reels

$4.22153
$4.47051

Service
Alan

1 week
2 weeks (Firm)

13. 44,800 130220 Ft. – 2” x 20 ft. PVC Sch. 40 Conduit w/belled ends 
(2,800 ft. lifts)

$.5045 Allied 2 weeks

14. 3,000 133620 Ft. 6” x 20 ft. Bore-Gard Conduit, Carlon #BG640SP-
020

$5.9063 Allied 2 weeks
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Bidder: Kriz-Davis Company
Grand Island, NE

Exceptions: Noted

Bid Price:

#
Quantity 

Requested
City Stock

Code Description
No 

Subs
Vendor’s

Bid Mfg. Delivery
1. 1 108595 Each – Padmount Switch Gear – Federal Pacific 

#PSE-12-44132-AS3-F2-HR-T7, Painted light Gray, 
Stainless Steel Cabinet, DEADFRONT, Air 
Insulated, 15kV, 95kV BIL, with one(1) 3-Pole, 600 
Amp. Group Operated Auto-Jet Switch and Three (3) 
3-Phase Sets of use Mountings for DBU or SMU-20 
Fuses.  Includes Nine (9) Sets of FP Fuse End 
Fittings, Hinged Roof and One (1) 12” Non-
Compartmental Stainless Steel Base Spacer.  Federal 
Pacific or S & C only.

$16,635.00 S &C 6-7 weeks

2. 8 113450 Each – Nordic ND-450-WG-S10135XX-P107 
Sectionalizing Cabinets, 600 Amp., Painted Willow 
Green

X No Bid

3. 280 118166 Each – Cooper #LE215AB04T Stick Op Elbows - #2 
Aluminum URD

$21.55 Cooper 2-4 weeks

4. 240 118110 Each – Cooper #LE215AB05T Stick Op Elbows – 
1/0 Power Cable

$21.55 Cooper 2-4 weeks

5. 150 120676 Each – Cooper #TP615H24TC T-OP-KIT Stick Op 
Elbows 750 MCM Power Cable – Consisting of:  (1) 
DT625T T-Body, (1) LRTP615 LB Reduce Tap Plug, 
(1) CA625H Cable Adapter, (1) CC6C24T CU 
COMP CONN. & (1) LPC215 LB Protective Cap

X $344.00 Cooper 12-13 weeks

6. 45,000 128102 Ft. - #2 15kV Aluminum URD Stranded Compressed 
Concentric 220 Mil as per the City of Grand Island 
Specs Mfg. #161-23-3060 on 2,500 Reels

$1.865 ft Kerite 4-5 weeks

7. 120,000 128410 Ft. – 1/0 15kV Copper Power Cable – COMPACT – 
MV-105 as per the City of Grand Island Specs on 60 
x 2,000 ft. new non-returnable reels – Okonite & 
Kerite only

$3.82 ft Kerite 6-8 weeks

8. 12,000 128440 Ft. – 4/0 15kV Copper power cable – COMPACT – 
MV-105 as per the City of Grand Island Specs on 6 x 
2,000 ft. new non-returnable reels – Okonite & Kerite 
only

$5.65 ft Kerite 6-8 weeks

9. 14,400 128500 Ft. – 500 MCM 15kV Copper Power Cable 
COMPACT – MV-105 as per the City of Grand 
Island Specs on 12 x 1,200 ft. new, non-returnable 
reels – Okonite & Kerite only

$11.21 ft Kerite 6-8 weeks

10. 28,800 128750 Ft. – 750 MCM 15kV Copper Power Cable – 
COMPACT – MV-105 as per City of Grand Island 
Specs on 24 x 1,200 ft. new, non-returnable reels – 
Okonite & Kerite only

$15.883 ft Kerite 6-8 weeks

11. 30,000 146010 Ft. – 1/0 19Str. Soft Drawn Bare Copper on 15 x 
2,000 ft. new reels

$1,292.65 mft Nehring 7-10 days

12. 12,000 146350 Ft. – 350 MCM 37Str. Soft Drawn Bare Copper on 24 
x 500 ft. new reels

$4,289.95 mft Nehring 7-10 days

13. 44,800 130220 Ft. – 2” x 20 ft. PVC Sch. 40 Conduit w/belled ends 
(2,800 ft. lifts)

$56.23 cft Cantex 2-3 weeks

14. 3,000 133620 Ft. 6” x 20 ft. Bore-Gard Conduit, Carlon #BG640SP-
020

$499.00 cft Cantex 2-3 wseeks

cc: Tim Luchsinger, Utilities Director Bob Smith, Assist. Utilities Director
Mary Lou Brown, City Administrator Jaye Monter, Finance Director
Stacy Nonhoff, Purchasing Agent Pat Gericke, Utilities Admin. Assist.
Mark Merrill, Utility Warehouse Supervisor

P1737
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Approved as to Form ¤ ___________
June 6, 2014 ¤  City Attorney

R E S O L U T I O N    2014-144

WHEREAS, the City of Grand Island invited sealed bids for Pad-Mount Switch 
Gear, #2 Aluminum URD Cable, 1/0, 4/0, 500 & 750 CU Power Cable, according to plans and 
specifications on file with the Utilities Department; and

WHEREAS, on May 27, 2014, bids were received, opened and reviewed; and

WHEREAS, bids were requested on a per item basis, and bids accepted based on 
price, quality, delivery and economics, experience of the manufacturer, availability of service for 
repair and maintenance, and adaptability of the particular equipment for the specific use 
intended, four companies were selected to provide the items in accordance with the terms of the 
advertisement of bids and plans and specifications and all other statutory requirements contained 
therein, as listed below:

Kriz-
Davis

Wesco Graybar Dutton-Lainson

1 PSE12 $16,635.00 -------- No Bid $16,141.00
2 ND450 No Bid $1,910.00 No Bid No Bid
3 #2 Elbow $21.55 $21.45 $21.38 $21.15
4 1/0 Elbow $21.55 $21.45 $22.00 $21.15
5 750 Elbow $344.00 No Bid -------- No Bid
6 #2 Cable -------- $1.72 -------- No Bid
7 1/0 Cable -------- $3.30 -------- No Bid
8 4/0 Cable -------- $5.32 -------- No Bid
9 500 MCM Cable -------- $10.28 -------- No Bid
10 750 MCM Cable -------- $14.49 -------- No Bid
11 1/0 SDB CU -------- $1.38 -------- --------
12 350 MCM SDB CU -------- $4.56 -------- --------
13 2” PVC -------- $0.56 -------- $0.5250
14 6” Bore Gard -------- $5.50 -------- $5.7200

 + freight $877.00

Low bids for each item are as follows:

1 1 ea @ $16,141.00 =  $16,141.00 Dutton-Lainson
2 8 ea @ $1,910.00 = $15,280.00 Wesco
2 280 ea@ $21.15 =  $5,922.00 Dutton-Lainson
4 240 ea @ $21.15 =  $5,076.00 Dutton-Lainson
5 150 ea @ $344.00 = $51,600.00 Kriz-Davis
6 45,000 ea @ $1.72 = $77,400.00 Wesco
7 120,000 ea @ $3.30 = $396,000.00 Wesco
8 12,000 ea @ $5.32 =  $63,840.00 Wesco
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- 2 -

9 14,400 ea @ $10.28 =  $148,032.00 Wesco
10 28,800 ea @ $14.49 =  $417,312.00 Wesco
11 30,000 ea @ $1.38 =  $41,400.00 Wesco
12 12,000 ea @ $4.56 =  $54,720.00 Wesco
13 44,800 ea @ $0.5250 =  $23,520.00 Dutton-Lainson
14 3,000 ea @ $5.72 = 

+ freight
 $17,160.00

 + freight $877
Dutton-Lainson

Total = $1,334,280.00

WHEREAS, bids listed below are less than the estimate for the Pad Mount Switch 
Gear, #2 Aluminum URD Cable, 1/0, 4/0, 500 & 750 CU Power Cable:

Items #1, 3, 4, 13 and 14 from Dutton-Lainson in the amount of $67,819.00 + $877.00 for 
freight.

Items #2, 6, 7, 8, 9, 10, 11 and 12 from Wesco in the amount of $1,213,984.00.

Item #5 from Kriz-Davis in the amount of $51,600.00.

The total purchase price of all items listed is $1,334,280.00.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED BY THE MAYOR AND COUNCIL 
OF THE CITY OF GRAND ISLAND, NEBRASKA, that the bid from Dutton-Lainson in the 
amount of $67,819.00 + $877.00 for freight; the bid from Wesco in the amount of 
$1,213,984.00, and the bid from Kriz -Davis in the amount of $51,600.00, for Pad Mount Switch 
Gear, #2 Aluminum URD Cable, 1/0, 4/0, 500 & 750 CU Power Cable are hereby approved as 
the lowest responsible bids.

- - -

Adopted by the City Council of the City of Grand Island, Nebraska, June 10, 2014.

_______________________________
Jay Vavricek, Mayor

Attest:

___________________________
RaNae Edwards, City Clerk
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