5 City of Grand Island
"\ Tuesday, February 28, 2023
Council Session

Item G-5

#2023-40 - Approving Bid Award for Concrete Ready-Mix for 2023

Staff Contact: Keith Kurz PE, Interim Public Works Director
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Council Agenda Memo

From:

Shannon Callahan, Street Superintendent and

Jeff Wattier, Solid Waste Superintendent

Meeting:
Subject:

Presenter(s):

February 28, 2023

Background

Approving Bid Award for Concrete Ready-Mix for 2023
Keith Kurz PE, Interim Public Works Director

On January 14, 2023 the Streets Division and Solid Waste Division of the Public Works
Department advertised for bids for the purchase of Portland Cement Concrete Ready-Mix
to be used in conjunction with concrete repairs throughout the 2023 calendar year.

A primary and secondary bid award is being recommended which sets prices for more
than one producer so material can be purchased in the event the other producer(s) are not
delivering due to larger job demands or concrete plant shutdown/breakdown.

Discussion

Two (2) bids were received and opened on February 16, 2023. The bids were submitted
in accordance with the terms of the advertisement of bids and specifications and all other
statutory requirements contained therein with no exceptions.

Concrete Ready-Mix 2023- Bid Award Recommendation

Primary Award

Secondary Award

Concrete Ready-Mix; delivery to
various job sites in City Limits

47B-3500, Type IP

Gerhold Concrete Company, Inc.

of Grand Island, NE
$135.15 per cubic yard

Consolidated Concrete Co.
of Grand Island, NE
$150.75 per cubic yard

47B-3500, ALTERNATE

Gerhold Concrete Company, Inc.

of Grand Island, NE
$135.15 per cubic yard

No Bid

47B-HE (High Early)

Gerhold Concrete Company, Inc.

of Grand Island, NE
$155.46 per cubic yard

Consolidated Concrete Co.
of Grand Island, NE
$166.75 per cubic yard

Flowable Fill

Consolidated Concrete Co.
of Grand Island, NE
$93.50 per cubic yard

Gerhold Concrete Company, Inc.
of Grand Island, NE
$94.75 per cubic yard
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Concrete Ready-Mix; delivery to
Grand Island Regional Landfill at
19550 West Husker Highway,

Shelton, Nebraska

47B-3500, Type IP

Gerhold Concrete Company, Inc.

of Grand Island, NE
$139.20 per cubic yard

Consolidated Concrete Co.
of Grand Island, NE
$157.20 per cubic yard

47B-3500, ALTERNATE

Gerhold Concrete Company, Inc.

of Grand Island, NE
$139.20 per cubic yard

No Bid

47B-HE (High Early)

Gerhold Concrete Company, Inc.

of Grand Island, NE
$159.51 per cubic yard

Consolidated Concrete Co.
of Grand Island, NE
$173.20 per cubic yard

Flowable Fill

Gerhold Concrete Company, Inc.

of Grand Island, NE
$98.75 per cubic yard

Consolidated Concrete Co.
of Grand Island, NE
$99.45 per cubic yard

Alternatives

It appears that the Council has the following alternatives concerning the issue at hand.

The Council may:

b s

Move to approve

Refer the issue to a Committee
Postpone the issue to future date
Take no action on the issue

Recommendation

City Administration recommends that the Council approve the purchase of Concrete

Ready-Mix 2023 according to the bid award recommendation.

Sample Motion

Move to approve the purchase of Concrete Ready-Mix 2023 according to the bid award

recommendation.
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CITY OF

Purchasing Division of Legal Department
INTEROFFICE MEMORANDUM

Stacy Nonhof, Purchasing Agent

GRAND "‘? ISLAND

BID OPENING DATE:
FOR:
DEPARTMENT:

ESTIMATE:

FUND/ACCOUNT:

PUBLICATION DATE:

NO. POTENTIAL BIDDERS:

Bidder:
Exceptions:

Bid Price:

47B-3500, Type IP:
47B-3500, Alternative:
47B-HE (High Early):
Flowable Fill:

Bidder:
Exceptions:

Bid Price:

47B-3500, Type IP:
47B-3500, Alternative:
47B-HE (High Early):
Flowable Fill:

BID OPENING

February 16, 2023 at 2:15 p.m.
Concrete Ready-Mix for 2023
Public Works

$135.00/Streets
$145.00/Solid Waste

21033503
50530043

January 14, 2023

2

SUMMARY

Gerhold Concrete

Norfolk, NE

None

City Limits Landfill
$135.15 $139.20
$135.15 $139.20
$155.46 $159.51
$ 94.75 $ 98.75
Consolidated Concrete Co
Hastings, NE

Noted

City 7imits Landfill
$150.75 $157.20
$150.75 $157.20
$166.75 $173.20
$ 93.50 $ 99.45

Working Together for a
Better Tomorrow, Today
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cc: Keith Kurz, Interim Public Works Director Shannon Callahan, Street Superintendent
Jeff Wattier, Solid Waste Superindendent Patrick Brown, Finance Director
Stacy Nonhof, Purchasing Agent Catrina DeLosh, Admin. Asst. Public Works

P2418
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RESOLUTION 2023-40

WHEREAS, the City of Grand Island invited sealed bids for furnishing Concrete
Ready-Mix for 2023 for the Streets Division and Solid Waste Division of the Public Works
Department, according to specifications on file with the Public Works Department; and

WHEREAS, on February 16, 2023, bids were received, opened and reviewed; and

WHEREAS, Gerhold Concrete Co., Inc. and Consolidated Concrete Co., both of
Grand Island, Nebraska, submitted a bid in accordance with the terms of the advertisement of
bids and specifications and all other statutory requirements contained therein; and

Concrete Ready-Mix 2023- Bid Award Recommendation

Primary Award

Secondary Award

Concrete Ready-Mix; delivery to
various job sites in City Limits

47B-3500, Type IP

Gerhold Concrete Company, Inc.

of Grand Island, NE
$135.15 per cubic yard

Consolidated Concrete Co.
of Grand Island, NE
$150.75 per cubic yard

47B-3500, ALTERNATE

Gerhold Concrete Company, Inc.

of Grand Island, NE
$135.15 per cubic yard

No Bid

47B-HE (High Early)

Gerhold Concrete Company, Inc.

of Grand Island, NE
$155.46 per cubic yard

Consolidated Concrete Co.
of Grand Island, NE
$166.75 per cubic yard

Flowable Fill

Consolidated Concrete Co.
of Grand Island, NE
$93.50 per cubic yard

Gerhold Concrete Company, Inc.
of Grand Island, NE
$94.75 per cubic yard

Concrete Ready-Mix; delivery to
Grand Island Regional Landfill at
19550 West Husker Highway,
Shelton, Nebraska

47B-3500, Type IP

Gerhold Concrete Company, Inc.

of Grand Island, NE
$139.20 per cubic yard

Consolidated Concrete Co.
of Grand Island, NE
$157.20 per cubic yard

47B-3500, ALTERNATE

Gerhold Concrete Company, Inc.

of Grand Island, NE
$139.20 per cubic yard

No Bid

47B-HE (High Early)

Gerhold Concrete Company, Inc.

of Grand Island, NE
$159.51 per cubic yard

Consolidated Concrete Co.
of Grand Island, NE
$173.20 per cubic yard

Flowable Fill

Gerhold Concrete Company, Inc.

of Grand Island, NE
$98.75 per cubic yard

Consolidated Concrete Co.
of Grand Island, NE
$99.45 per cubic yard
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NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED BY THE MAYOR AND COUNCIL
OF THE CITY OF GRAND ISLAND, NEBRASKA, that the below bids for concrete ready-mix
purchased in the 2023 calendar year, are hereby approved.

Adopted by the City Council of the City of Grand Island, Nebraska, February 28, 2023.

Roger G. Steele, Mayor

Attest:

RaNae Edwards, City Clerk
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