
City of Grand Island
Tuesday, January 11, 2022

Council Session

Item G-7

#2022-6 - Approving Bid Award for Asphalt Hot-Mix 2022

Staff Contact: John Collins, P.E. - Public Works Director
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Council Agenda Memo

From: Shannon Callahan, Streets Superintendent

Meeting: January 11, 2022

Subject: Approving Bid Award for Asphalt Hot-Mix 2022

Presenter(s): John Collins PE, Public Works Director

Background

Asphalt Hot-Mix is used by the Streets Division’s asphalt crew throughout the 
construction season to patch potholes and full-depth patch sections of roadways that are 
showing signs of failure.

Bidders are given the opportunity to write-in mixes that they know they will be producing 
this season. This allows a wider variety of mixes with set prices to be available to the 
Streets Division. The purchase of asphalt can then be based on the type of mix best suited 
for each patching job.

Discussion

Bids were advertised on December 4, 2021 and sent to four (4) potential bidders. Two (2) 
bid was received and opened on December 22, 2021.

Asphalt Hot-Mix 2022
Bid Award Recommendation

Standard Mix Id Binder Primary Award Secondary Award

Type SPR 64-34 J.I.L. Asphalt Paving Co. 
$58.40 per ton

Gary Smith Construction Co. 
$69.53 per ton

Alternate Mix Id Binder Primary Award Secondary Award
J.I.L. Asphalt Paving Co.

Type SPR 64-22
$54.70 per ton

Gray Smith Construction Co. 
$61.35 per ton

J.I.L. Asphalt Paving Co.
Type SPR Fine 64-22

$55.20 per ton
Gary Smith Construction Co.

$65.00 per ton
J.I.L. Asphalt Paving Co.

Type SLX 64-22
$58.10 per ton

Gary Smith Construction Co.
$75.00 per ton

Type A 64-22 Gary Smith Construction Co. No Bid

Grand Island Council Session - 1/11/2022 Page 2 / 5



$65.00 per ton
Type B 64-22 No Bid No Bid

Type B/C 64-22
Gary Smith Construction Co.

$58.00 per ton
Note:  B/CR mix

No Bid

J.I.L. Asphalt Paving Co.
Type C 64-22

$68.35 per ton
No Bid

Alternatives

It appears that the Council has the following alternatives concerning the issue at hand. 
The Council may:

1. Move to approve
2. Refer the issue to a Committee
3. Postpone the issue to future date
4. Take no action on the issue

Recommendation

City Administration recommends that the Council approve the purchase of Asphalt Hot-
Mix 2022 according to the bid award recommendation.

Sample Motion

Move to approve the purchase of the Asphalt Hot-Mix 2022 according to the bid award 
recommendation.
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Purchasing Division of Legal Department 

INTEROFFICE MEMORANDUM 

             

  Stacy Nonhof, Purchasing Agent 

 
Working Together for a 

                     Better Tomorrow, Today 

 

 

 BID OPENING 

 

BID OPENING DATE:  December 22, 2021 at 2:00 p.m. 

 

FOR:     Asphalt Hot-Mix for 2022 

 

DEPARTMENT:   Public Works 

 

ESTIMATE:    $70.00/Ton 

 

FUND/ACCOUNT:   21033503-85547 

 

PUBLICATION DATE:  December 4, 2021 

 

NO. POTENTIAL BIDDERS: 4 

 

 SUMMARY 

 

Bidder:  J.I.L. Asphalt Paving Co.   Gary Smith Const. Co., Inc. 

   Grand Island, NE    Grand Island, NE 

Exceptions:  None      Noted 

 

Bid Price: 

SPR 64-34:  $58.40 per ton    $69.53 per ton 

SPR 64-22:  $54.70 per ton    $61.35 per ton 

SPR Fine:  $55.20 per ton    $65.00 per ton 

Type SLX:  $58.10 per ton    $75.00 per ton 

Type A:  No Bid      $65.00 per ton 

Type B:  No Bid      No Bid 

Type B/CR  No Bid      $58.00 per ton 

Type C:  $68.35 per ton    No Bid 

 

 

 

cc: John Collins, Public Works Director    Shannon Callahan, Street Superintendent 

 Jerry Janulewicz, City Administrator    Patrick Brown, Finance Director 

 Stacy Nonhof, Purchasing Agent    Catrina DeLosh, Admin. Asst. Public Works 

 

P2332 
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Approved as to Form ¤ ___________
January 7, 2022 ¤  City Attorney

R E S O L U T I O N    2022-6

WHEREAS, the City of Grand Island invited sealed bids for furnishing Asphalt Hot-
Mix for 2022, according to plans and specifications on file with the Public Works Department; and

WHEREAS, on December 22, 2021 bids were received, opened and reviewed; and, 

WHEREAS, J.I.L. Asphalt Paving Co. and Gary Smith Construction Co. submitted 
responsible bids within the bid specifications for Asphalt Hot-Mix 2022.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED BY THE MAYOR AND COUNCIL OF 
THE CITY OF GRAND ISLAND, NEBRASKA, that the below bids for asphalt hot-mix purchased in 
the 2022 calendar year, are hereby approved;

Asphalt Hot-Mix 2022
Bid Award Recommendation

Standard Mix Id Binder Primary Award Secondary Award

Type SPR 64-34 J.I.L. Asphalt Paving Co. 
$58.40 per ton

Gary Smith Construction Co. 
$69.53 per ton

Alternate Mix Id Binder Primary Award Secondary Award
J.I.L. Asphalt Paving Co.

Type SPR 64-22
$54.70 per ton

Gray Smith Construction Co. 
$61.35 per ton

J.I.L. Asphalt Paving Co.
Type SPR Fine 64-22

$55.20 per ton
Gary Smith Construction Co.

$65.00 per ton
J.I.L. Asphalt Paving Co.

Type SLX 64-22
$58.10 per ton

Gary Smith Construction Co.
$75.00 per ton

Type A 64-22 Gary Smith Construction Co.
$65.00 per ton No Bid

Type B 64-22 No Bid No Bid

Type B/C 64-22
Gary Smith Construction Co.

$58.00 per ton
Note:  B/CR mix

No Bid

J.I.L. Asphalt Paving Co.
Type C 64-22

$68.35 per ton
No Bid

- - -
Adopted by the City Council of the City of Grand Island, Nebraska, January 11, 2022.

____________________________________
Roger G. Steele, Mayor

Attest:

_______________________________________
RaNae Edwards, City Clerk
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